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Five brides for five brothers…at least that’s the deal the Daltons have struck with their boys. Each son must
marry in order to inherit a piece of the ranch they love so much.

Beck Dalton is one of the most arrogant, immature and infuriating men Sabrina has ever met. But he also
happens to be the father of her child. Trouble is, he doesn’t know it. Over a year ago she made the mistake of
giving Beck a second chance—then a third. Mostly because he made her fire burn hotter and brighter than
with any other man. But having toe-curling romps in the hay with him didn’t make her stop wanting to bash
him over the head with a large, heavy object.

The part-time school teacher sent Beck into fits of insanity—right before she drove off with his clothes and
truck, leaving him naked in the middle of nowhere with nothing but his guitar and cell phone. At least he’d
had something to pass the time. Now the woman he’s never forgotten has walked back into his life. And she
has a secret.

What she’s holding has blue eyes that scream “Dalton boy,” and there’s no denying the infant’s parentage.
When Beck not only discovers he’s a daddy but his child and the mother are homeless, his honor forces him
to do the right thing even as he wants to throttle Sabrina.

She’ll let Beck help her get on her feet, but that doesn’t mean she has to like him, does it? Too bad her body
remembers every breathless moment spent with the rugged cowboy.
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From reader reviews:

Clayton Medina:

The guide with title Cowboy Secret (The Dalton Boys Book 4) contains a lot of information that you can
understand it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. This book exist new knowledge the information
that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to learn
how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you with new era of the syndication. You can read
the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Brenda Lewis:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Aim to
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't judge book by its protect may doesn't work is
difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the outside seem
likes. Maybe you answer could be Cowboy Secret (The Dalton Boys Book 4) why because the great cover
that make you consider about the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is actually
fantastic as the outside or cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly guide you to pick up this book.

Nona Smith:

Within this era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more special than other.
Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you have to do is
just spending your time little but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of many books in the
top list in your reading list is definitely Cowboy Secret (The Dalton Boys Book 4). This book which can be
qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking right up
and review this e-book you can get many advantages.

Carmine Caulfield:

As a student exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library or make
summary for some publication, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's heart or real their
leisure activity. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to presently there but
nothing reading really. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring along with can't see colorful
pictures on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we know
that on this age, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore , this Cowboy Secret (The Dalton Boys Book 4) can make you feel more
interested to read.
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